

**SNIFFEN & SPELLMAN, P.A.**  
 123 North Monroe Street  
 Tallahassee, Florida 32301  
 Phone: (850) 205-1996 Fax: (850) 205-3004  
 Federal I.D. #20-2446163

**Terms: Due Upon Receipt**

Attn: Bruce Bickner  
 Clay County School Board  
 3383 Olympic Drive  
 Green Cove Springs FL 32043-8097

Page 1  
 December 09, 2014  
 Account No: 3034-003  
 Statement No: 13282

Petition for Writ of Mandamus

SCHOOL BOARD OF CLAY COUNTY, FLORIDA vs.  
 CLAY COUNTY, by and through its BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

**REMINDER STATEMENT FOR LEGAL SERVICES**

09/24/2014 Review email correspondence from Mr. Bitner regarding the attorneys fees issue  
 (No charge).

Previous Balance \$52,221.24

Total Balance Due \$52,221.24

Aged Due Amounts					
<u>0-30</u>	<u>31-60</u>	<u>61-90</u>	<u>91-120</u>	<u>121-180</u>	<u>181+</u>
0.00	0.00	52,221.24	0.00	0.00	0.00

Original statement sent via email to Bruce Bickner: jbbickner@clay.k12.fl.us

**Payments received after 12/02/2014 are not included on this statement.**

**PLEASE PAY THE BALANCE DUE**

**SNIFFEN & SPELLMAN, P.A.**

123 North Monroe Street  
Tallahassee, Florida 32301

Phone: (850) 205-1996 Fax: (850) 205-3004  
Federal I.D. #20-2446163

**Terms: Due Upon Receipt**

Attn: Bruce Bickner  
Clay County School Board  
3383 Olympic Drive  
Green Cove Springs FL 32043-8097

Page 1  
September 30, 2014  
Account No: 3034-003  
Statement No: 12788

Petition for Writ of Mandamus

SCHOOL BOARD OF CLAY COUNTY, FLORIDA vs.  
CLAY COUNTY, by and through its BOARD OF COUNTY COMMISSIONERS

**For Legal Services through August 31, 2014.**

**Thank you for allowing us to serve you.**

			Hours	
08/13/2014	TCH	(No Charge 0.3) Phone conference with Bruce Bickner, Maureen Daughton & Mark Logan (No Charge 0.3); strategy conference with litigation team; research case law; review August 12, 2014 video from Board of County Commissioners (BCC) meeting.	3.80	570.00
	RJS	Begin analysis of Petition for Writ of Mandamus issue; strategy conference with litigation team regarding same.	3.10	620.00
	TW	Identify and review issues regarding preserving/downloading video of August 12, 2014 County Commission Meeting.	0.80	56.00
	MKL	Begin analysis of client's potential challenge to BCC action; research regarding same and potential Petition for Writ of Mandamus; conference with client regarding same; review video recording of August 12, 2014 meeting.	3.50	700.00
	MMD	(No Charge 0.3) Conference call with Bruce Bickner regarding possible new matter (No Charge 0.3); review documents, begin research for appropriate legal options.	1.80	360.00
08/14/2014	MMD	Review minutes, agenda package, review audio of the Clay County Board of County Commission meeting, research Mandamus proceeding and pleading requirements.	4.80	960.00
	TCH	Watch August 12, 2014 video of County Commission meeting; research caselaw regarding timeliness of requesting referendum; research Section 1001.461, Florida Statute.	5.20	780.00

## Petition for Writ of Mandamus

			Hours	
	RJS	Work on Petition for Writ of Mandamus analysis and related issues.	1.30	260.00
	MKL	Meeting with Rob Sniffen regarding Mandamus Action; research case law regarding same; review meetings of both School Board and BCC.	4.00	800.00
08/15/2014	MMD	(No Charge 0.5) Strategy conference regarding Petition for Writ of Mandamus issue with Mr. Logan (No Charge 0.5); continue to research pleading requirements for Petition.	3.80	760.00
	TCH	Search for Clay County Board of Commissioners resolution.	1.10	165.00
	RJS	Work on Petition for Writ of Mandamus.	1.50	300.00
	MKL	Review documentation in support of Petition for Writ of Mandamus; draft Petition.	6.00	1,200.00
08/17/2014	MMD	Review/Revise draft Petition for Writ of Mandamus; continue research efforts.	3.20	640.00
	TCH	Review draft of Petition for Writ of Mandamus; research for same.	4.00	600.00
	RJS	Work on revisions to Petition for Writ of Mandamus.	0.80	160.00
08/18/2014	MMD	Multiple conferences with Bruce Bickner; research caselaw regarding issues involving Petition for Writ of Mandamus; review the BCC special meeting.	7.00	1,400.00
	TCH	Research Mandamus caselaw; search for County Commissioners' resolution; telephone conference with Clay County recording secretary regarding same; telephone conference with Bruce Bickner and litigation team; research Section 125.15, Florida Statutes.	5.90	885.00
	RJS	Work on jurisdictional issues and Petition for Writ of Mandamus.	2.10	420.00
	MKL	Revise draft petition; monitor BCC meeting; email correspondence with client; secure and review documents needed for attachment to Petition.	8.00	1,600.00
08/19/2014	MMD	Revise Petition for Writ of Mandamus and prepare appendix.	6.50	1,300.00
	KMM	Research similar case determinations.	1.30	195.00
	TCH	Finish researching and working on Petition for Writ of Mandamus; research resolutions and minutes to use as supplemental authority with Petition; draft summary of research findings for supplemental authority.	8.50	1,275.00
	MKL	Further revise Petition based upon BCC meeting of August 18, 2014; file Petition; draft public records request; begin work on supplemental authorities; telephone conferences with client; research.	8.00	1,600.00

## Petition for Writ of Mandamus

			Hours	
	RJS	Work on Petition for Writ of Mandamus and record.	3.40	680.00
08/20/2014	MMD	Research "Governmental dispute" issue; attend strategy meeting with Mark Logan; review Notice of Supplemental Authority and accompanying exhibits; review correspondence from Judicial assistant regarding status conference; review appellate rule of procedure; review Attorney General opinions; conference with School Board counsel.	4.10	820.00
	JSJ	Research legal databases and dockets for relevant Florida Attorney General Opinion.	1.00	50.00
	JSJ	Research state and federal legal databases and dockets for multiple past judgments and orders.	3.30	165.00
	KMM	Research duty to negotiate and draft argument for Petition for Writ of Mandamus regarding same.	2.20	330.00
	MKL	Finalize and file supplemental authority as to other counties; review public records available for same; multiply conferences with client as to authorities; conferences with JA regarding hearing; filing of email designation, etc.; continue review of law in preparation for argument.	8.00	1,600.00
	TCH	Review Attorney General's opinion and other information regarding Polk County referendum request; draft notes of BCC meetings.	4.30	645.00
	RJS	(No Charge 1.3) Strategy conferences with Maureen Daughton and Mark Logan regarding hearings; preparation for hearing.		
08/21/2014	JSJ	Research legal databases and secondary sources to determine statutory interpretation of "timely request" in Florida.	4.00	200.00
	JSJ	Research Florida legislative history and Florida Constitution of 1855 for Florida Statutes, as existed in 1963.	1.00	50.00
	MKL	Prepare for status conference with Judge; attend status conference and agree to filing schedule; conference with client regarding same; review transcript of August 12, 2014 hearing; file transcript with court; research Florida Statutes regarding "timely request"; continue review of old Attorney General opinions.	10.00	2,000.00
	TCH	(No Charge 0.8) Draft notes from August 12 and 18, 2014 BCC meeting videos; status phone conference with Judge, litigation team and opposing counsel (No Charge); strategy meeting with Mark Logan and Rob Sniffen (No Charge); phone call with Bruce Bickner and litigation team (No Charge); research legislative history of Section 1001.461, Florida Statutes at State Archives; meeting with Mark Logan regarding research.	7.20	1,080.00

## Petition for Writ of Mandamus

		Hours	
	RJS Attend hearing by phone; post-hearing call with Bruce Bickner; work on arguments and issues.	2.30	460.00
	MMD (No Charge 0.4) Conference with Mark Logan regarding status hearing with Court and upcoming hearing on Petition for Writ of Mandamus (No Charge); review Notice of filing (No Charge); respond to email regarding issues related to presentation to the Court for hearing; review Public Records request to the County Commission; review Attorney General opinion.	1.10	220.00
08/22/2014	JSJ Research legal databases for any state or federal statutory interpretations of "timely request."	2.00	100.00
	JSJ Research legal databases for Florida cases involving statutory construction and interpretation of legislative intent.	1.00	50.00
	MKL Review and analyze constitutional authority; review archived public records laws; review responses to public records request; evaluate potential of subpoena issuance of Scruby materials; strategic conferences with client.	9.00	1,800.00
	TCH Research legislative history for Section 1001.461, Florida Statutes and Florida constitution; phone call with State Archives librarians; research at State Archives; email correspondence with librarians regarding research.	5.40	810.00
	RJS Work on issues for hearing.	0.80	160.00
	MMD (No Charge) Review email correspondence from Mark Logan regarding Constitutional History of Art. IX; review logistics for Monday and Tuesday.		
	TW Prepare and finalize potential demonstrative exhibits for hearing.	0.60	42.00
	JSJ Research legal databases for relevant statutory construction and legislative intent and draft memo to Mark Logan.	0.30	15.00
08/24/2014	MMD Prepare for Final hearing, review public records request; review transcript of Board of County commission meetings.	7.90	1,580.00
	MKL Prepare for hearing; pre-draft portions of Reply Brief; review case law and supplemental authorities; review constitutional history of statute.	6.50	1,300.00
	TCH Research timeliness of requesting referendum caselaw.	0.50	75.00
08/25/2014	MMD Review response filed by County Commission; prepare and revise reply in response to filing of the County Commission.	11.00	2,200.00
	MKL Receive and review Response to Petition from Opposing Counsel; Draft and file Reply to Response; Prepare for Hearing.	14.00	2,800.00

## Petition for Writ of Mandamus

		Hours	
	TCH	Research "timely response" statutes and documents for judicial notice; read and analyze Response to Petition; research caselaw cited in Responses; 57.105 caselaw research; draft analysis of same; research statutory law cited in Response; sheppardize case law used in Reply to Response; proofread and edit multiple drafts of Reply to Response.	12.90      1,935.00
	RJS	Work on Reply.	1.30      260.00
	JSJ	Research FL Statutes and FL Constitution regarding special election date requirements and draft memo to Mark Logan.	0.60      30.00
08/26/2014	MMD	Travel to and from Green Cove Springs; attend the Final hearing; prepare the Order Granting Petition for Writ of Mandamus; conference with the School Board counsel.	10.70      2,140.00
	JDS	Review and revise proposed order.	0.10      15.00
	MKL	Travel to Clay County Court House for Hearing; prepare for and attend hearing; travel from Clay County to Tallahassee; telephone conference with Judge regarding Ruling; telephone conference with client regarding same; review draft final order from opposing counsel; draft final order; email correspondence from Judge's office regarding final order; telephone conferences regarding potential for inaction or refusal of action by BCC; review BCC agenda item 8; review media.	12.00      2,400.00
	TCH	Search for proposed orders granting Writ of Mandamus; proofread and edit proposed Order granting Petition.	4.20      630.00
	RJS	Work on Order; multiple strategy conferences with litigation team regarding same/related issues/remedies for BOCC's referral to follow order.	4.10      820.00
08/27/2014	MMD	Conference with School Board counsel; review issue of Stay of Writ of Mandamus; review Motion to Vacate Stay; review time requirements of Sunshine Law for an emergency meeting to be called by Clay County Commission.	2.40      480.00
	MKL	Review Order of Judge; review media; conference with Maureen Daughton regarding fees issue; email client.	0.50      100.00
	MKL	Review email from M. Scruby regarding Thursday meeting of BCC.	0.20      40.00
	MKL	Telephone conference with client regarding anticipated next steps; review Appellate Rules; conference with Maureen Daughton regarding same; draft Emergency Motion to Vacate Automatic Stay and Draft Order Granting Motion and communicate same with client; telephone conference with Judge Borello's JA regarding logistics of emergency hearing.	3.00      600.00

Petition for Writ of Mandamus

		Hours	
	RJS Work on issues relating to Stay.	1.00	200.00
	TCH Review and edit regarding Motion to Vacate Automatic Stay.	0.90	135.00
	JSJ Research legal databases for rules regarding emergency motions and Clay County charter for rules regarding emergency meetings called by the County Commission; draft memo to Mark Logan.	2.00	100.00
08/28/2014	MMD Conference with Mr. DeVault; review Special Meeting of the BCC.	0.70	140.00
	TCH Research case law regarding Motion to Vacate Stay pending review; email correspondence with Bruce Bickner and litigation team.	5.40	810.00
	MKL Review research on public notice requirements for BCC emergency meeting; further research on case law in support of Motion to Vacate Automatic Stay; Revise Motion to Vacate Stay; email correspondence with client; telephone conference with opposing counsel; telephone conference with client; telephone conference with Judge Borrello's JA.	7.00	1,400.00
	RJS Receipt and review of information regarding Commission decision; strategy conferences with litigation team regarding same.	0.90	180.00
	Total for Current Services	<u>276.80</u>	<u>49,253.00</u>

Summary by Timekeeper

<u>Timekeeper</u>	<u>Hours</u>	<u>Rate</u>
Robert J. Sniffen	22.60	\$200.00
Trae Wylie	1.40	70.00
Mark K. Logan	99.70	200.00
Kenyetta M. Mullins	3.50	150.00
Jeff D. Slanker	0.10	150.00
Maureen M. Daughton	65.00	200.00
Jeffery Sampson, Jr.	15.20	50.00
Todd C. Hunter, Jr.	69.30	150.00

Expenses/Advances

08/01/2014	Photocopy charges - August 2014 (1097 pages at \$0.15)	164.55
08/01/2014	Photocopy charges - August 2014 (1354 pages at \$0.15)	203.10
	Photocopy charges	<u>367.65</u>
08/26/2014	Mileage - MMD mileage during travel to Hearing (360 miles @ \$.55)	198.00
	Mileage	<u>198.00</u>
08/19/2014	Postage - (3 at \$2.66)	7.98
	Postage	<u>7.98</u>

## Petition for Writ of Mandamus

	Total Expenses Thru 09/30/2014	<u>573.63</u>
08/01/2014	Online legal research - Westlaw (August 2014)	48.70
08/01/2014	Online legal research - Westlaw (August 2014)	74.53
08/01/2014	Online legal research - Westlaw (August 2014)	296.47
08/01/2014	Online legal research - Westlaw (August 2014)	60.08
08/01/2014	Online legal research - Westlaw (August 2014)	58.60
08/19/2014	Filing fee - E-Portal Reference No.: 17243939	412.00
08/21/2014	Court Reporter fee - Riley Reporting & Associates, Inc., Invoice No.: 14-1939	807.95
08/21/2014	Miscellaneous Advance - Florida Department of State Archives	7.50
08/22/2014	Court Reporter fee - Riley Reporting & Associates, Inc., Invoice No.: 14-1966	504.00
08/25/2014	Outside professional fee - Action Legal Discovery Services, Invoice No.: 5512	39.78
08/27/2014	Court Reporter fee - Riley Reporting & Associates, Inc., Invoice No.: 12-2016	<u>85.00</u>
	Total Advances	2,394.61
	Total Current Charges	52,221.24
	Total Balance Due	<u>\$52,221.24</u>

Original statement sent via email to Bruce Bickner: jbbickner@clay.k12.fl.us

**Payments received after 9/29/14 are not included on this statement.**



QuickView+ - Report

Account: SNIFFEN & SPELLMAN PA, TALLAHASSEE FL (1003252002)  
 Date Range: August 01, 2014 - August 31, 2014  
 Report Format: Detail-Account by Client by User  
 Products: Westlaw, WestlawNext  
 Content Families: All Content Families

Account by Client by User	Database Time	Transactions	Docs/Lines	Connect Time	Standard Charge	Special Pricing Charge	Tax Amount	Total Charge
Client 3043.003								
User Name TRAE,WYLIE (8380852)								
Excluded								
COMMUNICATIONS					0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD
TIME CLASS	0:18:27				983.94 USD	291.23 USD	0.00 USD	291.23 USD
WESTLAW LINES			354		17.70 USD	5.24 USD	0.00 USD	5.24 USD
Totals for Excluded	0:18:27		354		1,001.64 USD	296.47 USD	0.00 USD	296.47 USD
Totals for User Name TRAE,WYLIE (8380852)	0:18:27		354		1,001.64 USD	296.47 USD	0.00 USD	296.47 USD
Totals for Client 3043.003	0:18:27		354		1,001.64 USD	296.47 USD	0.00 USD	296.47 USD
Client 3043.003								
User Name TRAE,WYLIE (8380852)								
Included								
COMMUNICATIONS					0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD
TIME CLASS	4:46:44				3,447.95 USD	73.22 USD	0.00 USD	73.22 USD
WESTLAW LINES			1,235		61.75 USD	1.31 USD	0.00 USD	1.31 USD
Totals for Included	4:46:44		1,235		3,509.70 USD	74.53 USD	0.00 USD	74.53 USD
Totals for User Name TRAE,WYLIE (8380852)	4:46:44		1,235		3,509.70 USD	74.53 USD	0.00 USD	74.53 USD
Totals for Client 3043.003	4:46:44		1,235		3,509.70 USD	74.53 USD	0.00 USD	74.53 USD
Client 3034.003								
User Name MULLINS,KENYETTA M (12435918)								
Included								
COMMUNICATIONS					0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD
TIME CLASS	1:49:40				1,075.34 USD	22.84 USD	0.00 USD	22.84 USD
WESTLAW LINES			51		2.55 USD	0.05 USD	0.00 USD	0.05 USD
Totals for Included	1:49:40		51		1,077.89 USD	22.89 USD	0.00 USD	22.89 USD
Totals for User Name MULLINS,KENYETTA M (12435918)	1:49:40		51		1,077.89 USD	22.89 USD	0.00 USD	22.89 USD
User Name TRAE,WYLIE (8380852)								
Included								
COMMUNICATIONS					0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD	0.00 USD
TIME CLASS	1:43:56				1,215.13 USD	25.81 USD	0.00 USD	25.81 USD
Totals for Included	1:43:56				1,215.13 USD	25.81 USD	0.00 USD	25.81 USD
Totals for User Name TRAE,WYLIE (8380852)	1:43:56				1,215.13 USD	25.81 USD	0.00 USD	25.81 USD
Totals for Client 3034.003	3:33:36		51		2,293.02 USD	48.70 USD	0.00 USD	48.70 USD

E

E

\*

E

\* 3

QuickView+ - Report

Account: SNIFFEN & SPELLMAN PA, TALLAHASSEE FL (1003252002)  
 Date Range: August 01, 2014 - August 31, 2014  
 Report Format: Detail-Account by Client by User  
 Products: Westlaw, WestlawNext  
 Content Families: All Content Families

Account by Client by User	Database Time	Transactions	Docs/Lines	Connect Time	Standard Charge	Special Pricing Charge	Tax Amount	Total Charge
Client 3034.002 3								
User Name HUNTER, TODD C (13038073)								
Excluded								
DOCUMENT DISPLAYS		2			198.00 USD	58.60 USD	0.00 USD	58.60 USD
Totals for Excluded		2			198.00 USD	58.60 USD	0.00 USD	58.60 USD
Totals for User Name HUNTER, TODD C (13038073)		2			198.00 USD	58.60 USD	0.00 USD	58.60 USD
Totals for Client 3034.002		2			198.00 USD	58.60 USD	0.00 USD	58.60 USD
Client 3034.002 3								
User Name HUNTER, TODD C (13038073)								
Included								
KEYCITE		8			104.00 USD	2.21 USD	0.00 USD	2.21 USD
DOCUMENT DISPLAYS		91			1,225.00 USD	26.01 USD	0.00 USD	26.01 USD
TRANSACTIONAL SEARCHES		40			1,500.00 USD	31.85 USD	0.00 USD	31.85 USD
Totals for Included		139			2,829.00 USD	60.08 USD	0.00 USD	60.08 USD
Totals for User Name HUNTER, TODD C (13038073)		139			2,829.00 USD	60.08 USD	0.00 USD	60.08 USD
Totals for Client 3034.002		139			2,829.00 USD	60.08 USD	0.00 USD	60.08 USD

Cara Worth

3034.003

**Subject:** FW: Filing Received

---

**From:** [noreply@myflcourtagency.com](mailto:noreply@myflcourtagency.com) [mailto:noreply@myflcourtagency.com]

**Sent:** Tuesday, August 19, 2014 11:08 AM

**Subject:** Filing Received

Dear Mark K. Logan:

This email verifies the receipt of 2 documents submitted by you to Clay Circuit Civil on 08/19/2014 11:08:24 AM.

UCN:

Clerk Case #:	NEW CASE
Case Style:	School Board of Clay County, Florida VS Clay County Board of County C
Document Title:	Miscellaneous Miscellaneous
Matter #:	
Total Filing Fees:	\$400.00
Statutory Convenience Fee:	\$12.00
Total Paid:	\$412.00
Paid By:	Pay By Credit/Debit Card
MyFloridaCounty Receipt #:	10999347

**The E-Portal reference number of this filing is: 17243939.** Please reference this Filing # in any correspondence.

We will notify you when processing is complete.

This is a non-monitored email. Do not reply directly to it. If you have any questions about this filing please contact the Clay Circuit Civil division.

Thank you,  
The Florida Courts E-Filing Portal

03034.00#3

Riley Reporting & Associates, Inc.

1660 Prudential Drive  
Suite 210  
Jacksonville, FL 32207  
Fed. Id. No. 59-3222392

Invoice

Date	Invoice #
8/21/2014	14-1939

Bill To:

Mark K. Logan, Esquire  
Sniffen & Spellman, P.A.  
123 North Monroe Street  
Tallahassee, Florida 32301

Terms	Reporter
Net 30	TM

Description	Serviced	Amount
Attendance Reporter (to rewrite audio)	8/12/2014	85.00
Transcript Original & Condensed Copy (2-day expedite)		715.00
PDF transcript		0.00
Postage		7.95
 Board of County Commissioners Meeting Clay County, Florida  Excerpts of Proceedings		

Thank you for your business, Tanya McCranie, RMR.

**Total** **\$807.95**

FLORIDA DEPT OF STATE  
STATE ARCHIVES  
850 245 6700

3034.003

REG 08-21-2014 15:10  
000020

30 X @0.25  
COPIES T1T2 \$7.50  
TOTAL \$7.50  
CASH \$20.00  
CHANGE \$12.50

03034.00#3

Riley Reporting & Associates, Inc.

1660 Prudential Drive  
Suite 210  
Jacksonville, FL 32207  
Fed. Id. No. 59-3222392

Invoice

Date	Invoice #
8/22/2014	14-1966

Bill To:

Mark K. Logan, Esquire  
Sniffen & Spellman, P.A.  
123 North Monroe Street  
Tallahassee, Florida 32301

Terms	Reporter
Net 30	TM

Description	Serviced	Amount
Attendance Reporter Transcript Original & Condensed Copy (2-day expedite) PDF transcript	8/18/2014	75.00 429.00 0.00
Board of County Commissioners Meeting Clay County, Florida  Excerpts of Proceedings		

Thank you for your business, Tanya McCranie, RMR.

**Total \$504.00**

Clay County 3034.003



117 EAST GEORGIA STREET  
TALLAHASSEE, FL 32301

PHONE: (850) 222-7526

**Invoice**

Date	Invoice No.
08/25/2014	5512
Terms	Due Date
Net 15	09/09/2014

<b>Bill To</b>
Sniffen and Spellman, P.A. 123 N Monroe St Tallahassee, FL 32301

<b>Ordered By:</b>	<b>Billing Ref.</b>
Trac	Clay County

Item	Description	Quantity	Rate	Amount
24x36	• 24x36 enlargement and mount	1	37.00	37.00T

Thank you for using Action Legal Discovery Services!

<b>SubTotal</b>	\$37.00
<b>Tax (7.5%)</b>	\$2.78
<b>Total</b>	\$39.78

RECEIVED BY:

Tax ID# 27-4126099

03034.003

Riley Reporting & Associates, Inc.

Invoice

1660 Prudential Drive  
Suite 210  
Jacksonville, FL 32207  
Fed. Id. No. 59-3222392

Date	Invoice #
8/27/2014	14-2016

Bill To:

Mark K. Logan, Esquire  
Sniffen & Spellman, P.A.  
123 North Monroe Street  
Tallahassee, Florida 32301

Terms Reporter  
Net 30 TM

Description	Serviced	Amount
Attendance Reporter	8/26/2014	85.00
School Board of Clay County, FL vs. Clay County Board of County Commissioners Case No.; 2014-CA-00983  Hearing before The Honorable Mark Borello  (TRANSCRIPT NOT ORDERED AT THIS TIME.)		0.00

Thank you for your business, Tanya McCranie, RMR.

**Total \$85.00**